
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Ref: Sec/SE/982/2019-2020 

28.03.2020 

 

BSE Limited 

Phiroze Jeejeebhoy Towers 

Dalal Street 

Mumbai- 400001 

 Scrip Code: 531213 

National Stock Exchange of India Limited 

5th Floor, Exchange Plaza 

Bandra (East) 

Mumbai – 400 051 

Scrip Code: MANAPPURAM 

 

Dear Madam/Sir 

 

Sub: Change in Credit Rating 

 

Fitch has placed the 'BB-' Long-Term Issuer Default Ratings (IDR) of Manappuram Finance 

Limited (MFIN) on Rating Watch Negative (RWN).  

 

ENTITY/DEBT RATING PRIOR 

Manappuram Finance 

Limited 

LT IDR BB-Rating Watch On BB-  

 LC LT IDR BB-Rating Watch On BB- 

Senior secured LT BB-Rating Watch On BB- 

 

 

Request you to kindly take the same on record. 

 

For Manappuram Finance Limited 

 

Sd/- 

 

Manojkumar V.R 

Company Secretary 

 

Ph:-9946239999 

Email-cs@manappuram.com 
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Fitch Downgrades 3 Indian NBFIs, On Negative Watch; 4th on Negative Watch
Fitch Ratings - Singapore/Mumbai - 27 March 2020:

Fitch Ratings has downgraded the Long-Term Issuer Default Ratings (IDRs) of Shriram Transport Finance Company Limited (STFC) and Muthoot
Finance Limited (MFL) to 'BB' from 'BB+'. It has also downgraded the Long-Term IDR of India Infoline Finance Limited (IIFL) to 'B+' from 'BB-'. All
their ratings have been placed on Rating Watch Negative (RWN). Fitch has also placed the 'BB-' Long-Term IDR of Manappuram Finance Limited
(MFIN) on RWN. A list of ratings is at the end of this release.

The rating actions reflect increasing macro-economic challenges for the Indian non-bank financial institution (NBFI) sector. These include the
growing effects from measures to contain the COVID-19 pandemic, which will compound the tightening in funding conditions for NBFIs in recent
weeks. The RBI's recent liquidity and regulatory support measures should help to improve the funding environment in the near term, but it also
underlines the severity of the situation and Fitch sees continued uncertainty in the coming months nonetheless.

Fitch also expects the constraints on business activity to lead to operational disruptions that will directly affect asset quality. This comes on top of
existing weak asset quality across banks and some NBFIs, and under-capitalisation in the banking system, which are likely to continue to hamper
the growth and funding of the NBFI sector. Fitch recently revised down India's GDP growth forecast for the fiscal year ending March 2021 (FY21) to
5.1%, from 5.6% previously, and the risks are skewed to the downside as the authorities attempt to contain the virus.

RATING ACTIONS
ENTITY/DEBT RATING RECOVERY PRIOR

Muthoot Finance Ltd
LT IDR
BB 
Downgrade

BB+ 

LC LT IDR
BB 
Downgrade

BB+ 

senior secured
LT
BB 
Downgrade

BB+ 

Shriram Transport Finance Company
Limited

LT IDR
BB 
Downgrade

BB+ 

https://www.fitchratings.com/site/pr/10114929
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ST IDR
B 
Affirmed

B 

LC LT IDR
BB 
Downgrade

BB+ 

senior unsecured
LT
BB 
Downgrade

BB+ 

senior secured
LT
BB 
Downgrade

BB+ 

India Infoline Finance Limited
LT IDR
B+ 
Downgrade

BB- 

senior secured
LT
B+ 
Downgrade

RR4 BB- 

Manappuram Finance Limited
LT IDR
BB- 
Rating Watch On

BB- 

LC LT IDR
BB- 
Rating Watch On

BB- 

senior secured
LT
BB- 
Rating Watch On

BB- 

Key Rating Drivers

IDRS

The weaker economic outlook and uncertain funding conditions negatively affect our assessment of the sector's operating environment, growth and
asset-quality prospects. The support measures announced by the RBI on 27 March should help address some near-term pressures on reported
asset-quality metrics and market liquidity, but will not materially change the anticipated deterioration in underlying borrower repayment capacity. We
also expect debt markets to remain risk averse, while banks are likely to be selective when providing fresh funds to the NBFI sector.
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The RWN on the ratings reflects sustained uncertainty in the near term, partly stemming from the authorities' measures to contain the spread of
COVID-19. All four entities have retained funding market access despite market dislocation in recent weeks, but any evidence of increased
refinancing risk, weaker funding access, or an outsized deterioration in asset quality could lead to further rating downside for the four NBFIs.

IIFL

The downgrade and RWN reflect our expectation of increased pressure on IIFL's asset quality, which will weigh on its funding and liquidity. SME
loans, developer financing and capital market finance, which Fitch perceives to be of higher risk in current conditions, make up 40%-45% of IIFL's
loan portfolio. Another 7% of loans were extended to microfinance at end-December 2019, which may also be more vulnerable in a downturn as
borrowers are typically less financially resilient.

We believe that IIFL's exposure to these risker loan segments renders it more susceptible to shifts in market confidence, and in the current
environment outweighs the relative resilience of its home loans and gold loans, which make up close to half of the loan book.

IIFL's IDR also reflects its moderate franchise in India's NBFI sector and experienced management team, as well as its appetite for high growth and
tolerance for elevated leverage.

We believe IIFL's funding and liquidity access remains weaker than that of other Fitch-rated peers and more vulnerable in times of heightened risk
aversion. This is despite the funding mix remaining stable and adequately balanced at present. The liquidity position and contingent liquidity
coverage remained broadly stable at end-February 2020 with net positive liquidity gaps and adequate contingent liquidity coverage of upcoming
liabilities. However, the company continues to be more reliant on loan assignments and securitisation to fund its portfolio, and existing liquidity
buffers can be eroded if the sector's funding strains are prolonged.

MFIN

MFIN's ratings reflect its moderate franchise in the niche of gold-backed financing, and its history of low credit losses and satisfactory leverage.
These are counterbalanced by elevated key-person risk, a track record of shortcomings in governance and operational management, and growing
risk appetite as the company pursues higher growth in non-gold backed financing segments, which are relatively new to MFIN.

The RWN takes into account potential earnings reduction as the unfavorable operating environment slows portfolio growth, particularly in gold loans
(currently 66% of the total portfolio), which amortise at a faster pace due to the product's short tenor. The asset quality of other segments is also
likely to deteriorate as borrower earnings are affected by slower domestic economic activity, while collections and recoveries may also be disrupted.

MFL

The downgrade and RWN reflect the weakening operating environment and the related operational challenges. Slower economic activity will
dampen MFL's business growth prospects, while its branch-led distribution model for gold-backed loans, which form 89% of MFL's total loans, will be
affected by disruptions from measures to contain the pandemic. Fitch expects delinquencies to rise as borrower earnings are affected by the slower
economic growth, while recoveries of the gold collateral backing the loans may be delayed as auctions may be affected in the near term.
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MFL's ratings nonetheless remain at the higher end of rated peers, reflecting the strength of its established franchise in niche gold-backed financing,
its history of low credit losses, satisfactory leverage and adequate liquidity coverage. These are counterbalanced by high exposure to operational
risks in the business and MFL's concentration in gold loans.

STFC

The downgrade and RWN on STFC's ratings largely stems from the deterioration in the operating environment for India NBFIs. STFC's portfolio will
face increased asset-quality risks as the commercial vehicle portfolio is more exposed to business activity in India that will be hampered by the
measures taken to tackle the coronavirus.

Fitch expects delays in loan collections and asset recoveries if current restrictions on business activity are prolonged. This would place pressure on
near-term on asset quality, credit costs and profitability. This comes as STFC already has the highest NPL ratio of Fitch's rated portfolio at 8.7% at
end-December 2019, with credit costs accounting for a significant 38%-58% of pre-provision profit. However, STFC's credit costs have been much
lower than NPLs and remained between 2.2%-3.8% of average loans over FY17-3QFY19.

STFC's ratings remain at the higher end of rated peers' as it has a dominant position in used commercial-vehicle financing, experienced
management, and an established track record in managing collections and recoveries while maintaining satisfactory earnings through past credit
cycles.

MTN PROGRAMMES, SENIOR SECURED DEBT, AND RECOVERY RATINGS

The ratings on the MTN programmes and foreign-currency senior debt of the entities are at the same level as their Long-Term Foreign-Currency
IDRs, while the rupee-denominated senior debt of STFC is rated at same level as its Long-Term Local-Currency IDR in accordance with Fitch's
rating criteria.

Most of India NBFIs' debt is secured and Fitch believes that non-payment of NBFIs' senior secured debt would best reflect uncured failure of the
entity. NBFIs can issue unsecured debt in the overseas market, but such debt is likely to constitute a small portion of its funding and thus cannot be
viewed as their primary financial obligations.

Fitch has assigned a Recovery Rating of 'RR4' to IIFL's senior secured debt rated at 'B+', in accordance with Fitch's criteria for entities with a Long-
Term IDR of 'B+' or below, reflecting 'Average' recovery prospects in the event of a default.

RATING SENSITIVITIES

IDRS

Fitch will re-assess the Rating Watch Negative on the ratings when the impact of measures to contain the coronavirus in India and steps to address
recent funding market constraints become clearer. A prolonged period of disruption to economic activity, signs of increased funding strain or an
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excessive deterioration in asset quality could lead to lower ratings for the entities, while an improvement in funding conditions and reduced asset
quality risks would ease the pressure on the ratings.

IIFL

A deterioration in asset quality, signs of more constrained funding access, narrowed or negative liquidity gaps or reduced liquidity buffers would lead
to negative rating action. Leverage increasing beyond 7x (December 2019: 5.1x) would also add to pressure on the ratings.

The ratings may be upgraded when there is greater evidence that IIFL is able to maintain and improve its funding and liquidity profile without over-
reliance on asset sales and securitisation, even as current market constraints continue. This is provided that the company demonstrates reasonably
steady collections on its developer financing, SME and microfinance portfolios throughout the period.

MFIN

The IDR would be under pressure from business disruptions or curtailed funding access due to adverse governance or operational events or
heightened risks from deterioration in the economic environment. The rating would also be sensitive to a rising risk appetite due to aggressive
growth in non-gold lending segments and a rise in leverage to beyond 5x (September 2019: 3.7x).

Fitch believes that the ratings have limited upside potential in the near term. The ability of the company to address the potential regulatory and
governance risks and manage the evolving business risks will be important before an upgrade can be considered.

MFL

The IDR may be downgraded if operational risk losses exceed Fitch's expectations, if asset quality or the price of gold collateral deteriorates sharply,
or if liquidity coverage or funding access were to weaken. The rating may also be downgraded if leverage were to increase and debt/tangible equity
were to exceed 4.5x for a prolonged period (September 2019: 2.8x), or if aggressive expansion in new lending segments leads Fitch to significantly
weaken our assessment of MFL's risk appetite and future asset quality.

An upgrade of MFL's Long-Term IDR would hinge on an improvement in the operating environment - including a strengthening in the domestic
financial system, which is unlikely in the near term - together with a steady record of expansion in its franchise beyond the niche gold loan market.
The latter is also only likely in the medium to longer term, if at all, as the company appears focused on its core niche markets in which it performs
generally well.

STFC

Negative action on the IDR may result if the funding and liquidity profile were to weaken. A rise in non-performing assets leading to higher credit
costs and impaired profitability could also weigh on the rating, especially if it leads to a lower leverage tolerance, given STFC's riskier business
profile. Leverage consistently greater than 5.5x (September 2019: 5.3x) would weigh on the IDR.

An upgrade of STFC's Long-Term IDR would depend on a material strengthening in the operating environment, including the domestic financial
system - which is unlikely in the near term - assuming other rating factors are also expected to be sustained at levels commensurate with a higher
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rating.

MTN PROGRAMMES, SENIOR SECURED DEBT, AND RECOVERY RATINGS

The ratings on the MTN programmes and senior secured debt would move in tandem with the entities' respective Long-Term IDRs. IIFL's Recovery
Ratings would be sensitive to Fitch's assessment of likely recoveries on its senior secured notes.

ESG Considerations

ESG issues are credit neutral or have only a minimal credit impact on the entity(ies), either due to their nature or the way in which they are being
managed by the entity(ies).  For more information on Fitch's ESG Relevance Scores, visit www.fitchratings.com/esg.

Additional information is available on www.fitchratings.com
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ALL FITCH CREDIT RATINGS ARE SUBJECT TO CERTAIN LIMITATIONS AND DISCLAIMERS. PLEASE READ THESE LIMITATIONS AND
DISCLAIMERS BY FOLLOWING THIS LINK: HTTPS://WWW.FITCHRATINGS.COM/UNDERSTANDINGCREDITRATINGS. IN ADDITION, THE
FOLLOWING https://www.fitchratings.com/site/dam/jcr:6b03c4cd-611d-47ec-b8f1-183c01b51b08/Rating%20Definitions%20-
%203%20May%202019%20v3%206-11-19.pdf DETAILS FITCH'S RATING DEFINITIONS FOR EACH RATING SCALE AND RATING
CATEGORIES, INCLUDING DEFINITIONS RELATING TO DEFAULT. PUBLISHED RATINGS, CRITERIA, AND METHODOLOGIES ARE
AVAILABLE FROM THIS SITE AT ALL TIMES. FITCH'S CODE OF CONDUCT, CONFIDENTIALITY, CONFLICTS OF INTEREST, AFFILIATE
FIREWALL, COMPLIANCE, AND OTHER RELEVANT POLICIES AND PROCEDURES ARE ALSO AVAILABLE FROM THE CODE OF CONDUCT
SECTION OF THIS SITE. DIRECTORS AND SHAREHOLDERS RELEVANT INTERESTS ARE AVAILABLE AT
HTTPS://WWW.FITCHRATINGS.COM/SITE/REGULATORY. FITCH MAY HAVE PROVIDED ANOTHER PERMISSIBLE SERVICE TO THE RATED
ENTITY OR ITS RELATED THIRD PARTIES. DETAILS OF THIS SERVICE FOR RATINGS FOR WHICH THE LEAD ANALYST IS BASED IN AN
EU-REGISTERED ENTITY CAN BE FOUND ON THE ENTITY SUMMARY PAGE FOR THIS ISSUER ON THE FITCH WEBSITE.

COPYRIGHT

Copyright © 2020 by Fitch Ratings, Inc., Fitch Ratings Ltd. and its subsidiaries. 33 Whitehall Street, NY, NY 10004. Telephone: 1-800-753-4824,
(212) 908-0500. Fax: (212) 480-4435. Reproduction or retransmission in whole or in part is prohibited except by permission. All rights reserved. In
issuing and maintaining its ratings and in making other reports (including forecast information), Fitch relies on factual information it receives from
issuers and underwriters and from other sources Fitch believes to be credible. Fitch conducts a reasonable investigation of the factual information
relied upon by it in accordance with its ratings methodology, and obtains reasonable verification of that information from independent sources, to the
extent such sources are available for a given security or in a given jurisdiction. The manner of Fitch's factual investigation and the scope of the third-
party verification it obtains will vary depending on the nature of the rated security and its issuer, the requirements and practices in the jurisdiction in
which the rated security is offered and sold and/or the issuer is located, the availability and nature of relevant public information, access to the
management of the issuer and its advisers, the availability of pre-existing third-party verifications such as audit reports, agreed-upon procedures
letters, appraisals, actuarial reports, engineering reports, legal opinions and other reports provided by third parties, the availability of independent
and competent third- party verification sources with respect to the particular security or in the particular jurisdiction of the issuer, and a variety of
other factors. Users of Fitch's ratings and reports should understand that neither an enhanced factual investigation nor any third-party verification
can ensure that all of the information Fitch relies on in connection with a rating or a report will be accurate and complete. Ultimately, the issuer and
its advisers are responsible for the accuracy of the information they provide to Fitch and to the market in offering documents and other reports. In
issuing its ratings and its reports, Fitch must rely on the work of experts, including independent auditors with respect to financial statements and
attorneys with respect to legal and tax matters. Further, ratings and forecasts of financial and other information are inherently forward-looking and
embody assumptions and predictions about future events that by their nature cannot be verified as facts. As a result, despite any verification of
current facts, ratings and forecasts can be affected by future events or conditions that were not anticipated at the time a rating or forecast was issued
or affirmed. 
The information in this report is provided "as is" without any representation or warranty of any kind, and Fitch does not represent or warrant that the
report or any of its contents will meet any of the requirements of a recipient of the report. A Fitch rating is an opinion as to the creditworthiness of a
security. This opinion and reports made by Fitch are based on established criteria and methodologies that Fitch is continuously evaluating and

https://www.fitchratings.com/UNDERSTANDINGCREDITRATINGS
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updating. Therefore, ratings and reports are the collective work product of Fitch and no individual, or group of individuals, is solely responsible for a
rating or a report. The rating does not address the risk of loss due to risks other than credit risk, unless such risk is specifically mentioned. Fitch is
not engaged in the offer or sale of any security. All Fitch reports have shared authorship. Individuals identified in a Fitch report were involved in, but
are not solely responsible for, the opinions stated therein. The individuals are named for contact purposes only. A report providing a Fitch rating is
neither a prospectus nor a substitute for the information assembled, verified and presented to investors by the issuer and its agents in connection
with the sale of the securities. Ratings may be changed or withdrawn at any time for any reason in the sole discretion of Fitch. Fitch does not provide
investment advice of any sort. Ratings are not a recommendation to buy, sell, or hold any security. Ratings do not comment on the adequacy of
market price, the suitability of any security for a particular investor, or the tax-exempt nature or taxability of payments made in respect to any
security. Fitch receives fees from issuers, insurers, guarantors, other obligors, and underwriters for rating securities. Such fees generally vary from
US$1,000 to US$750,000 (or the applicable currency equivalent) per issue. In certain cases, Fitch will rate all or a number of issues issued by a
particular issuer, or insured or guaranteed by a particular insurer or guarantor, for a single annual fee. Such fees are expected to vary from
US$10,000 to US$1,500,000 (or the applicable currency equivalent). The assignment, publication, or dissemination of a rating by Fitch shall not
constitute a consent by Fitch to use its name as an expert in connection with any registration statement filed under the United States securities laws,
the Financial Services and Markets Act of 2000 of the United Kingdom, or the securities laws of any particular jurisdiction. Due to the relative
efficiency of electronic publishing and distribution, Fitch research may be available to electronic subscribers up to three days earlier than to print
subscribers. 
For Australia, New Zealand, Taiwan and South Korea only: Fitch Australia Pty Ltd holds an Australian financial services license (AFS license no.
337123) which authorizes it to provide credit ratings to wholesale clients only. Credit ratings information published by Fitch is not intended to be used
by persons who are retail clients within the meaning of the Corporations Act 2001
Fitch Ratings, Inc. is registered with the U.S. Securities and Exchange Commission as a Nationally Recognized Statistical Rating Organization (the
"NRSRO"). While certain of the NRSRO's credit rating subsidiaries are listed on Item 3 of Form NRSRO and as such are authorized to issue credit
ratings on behalf of the NRSRO (see https://www.fitchratings.com/site/regulatory), other credit rating subsidiaries are not listed on Form NRSRO (the
"non-NRSROs") and therefore credit ratings issued by those subsidiaries are not issued on behalf of the NRSRO. However, non-NRSRO personnel
may participate in determining credit ratings issued by or on behalf of the NRSRO.

SOLICITATION STATUS

The ratings above were solicited and assigned or maintained at the request of the rated entity/issuer or a related third party. Any exceptions follow
below.

Endorsement Policy

Fitch's approach to ratings endorsement so that ratings produced outside the EU may be used by regulated entities within the EU for regulatory
purposes, pursuant to the terms of the EU Regulation with respect to credit rating agencies, can be found on the EU Regulatory Disclosures page.
The endorsement status of all International ratings is provided within the entity summary page for each rated entity and in the transaction detail
pages for all structured finance transactions on the Fitch website. These disclosures are updated on a daily basis.
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Fitch Updates Terms of Use & Privacy Policy

We have updated our Terms of Use and Privacy Policies which cover all of Fitch Group's websites. Learn more.

https://www.thefitchgroup.com/site/termsofuse
https://www.thefitchgroup.com/site/privacy
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